M Gmall jijo appachan <jijomary@gmail.com>

Fwd: Gmail - Financial support-T.K Rajeev Kumar.pdf

John P. Joseph <johnpj@hotmail.com> Sat, Jun 2, 2018 at 11:37 AM
To: jijo appachan <jijomary@gmail.com>

Please inform them accordingly

From: jijo appachan <jijomary@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, June 2, 2018 2:33 AM

To: John P. Joseph M I —_ @gmail N
1JO appachan <jijjoma mail.com
Subject: Re: Gmail - Financial support-T.K Rajee¥Ku ag.:?c'fl \al Jie=pp jomayes

Thankyou Johnicha.

May God Recompense

JijO jijo appachan <jijjomary@gmail.com> Sun, Jun 3, 2018 at 4:35 AM
To: "John P. Joseph" <johnpj@hotmail.com>

On 6/2/18, John P. Joseph <johnpj@hotmail.com> wrote:

S Dear Johnichan,
Can you ask bank to send me the Transaction (UTR) number?

Money transferred

> Suresh at Hyderabad Hospital may need it.
> John P.Joseph Meanwhile, Rajeev is fine. Shifted to lind level Post Operative Care.
> Sent from my iPhone ThankYou,
> Jijo
. [Quoted text hidden]
> Begin forwarded message:
>

> From: johnpj@hotmail.com<mailto:johnpj@hotmail.com>

> Date: June 2, 2018 at 12:15:11 AM GMT+4

> To: IDBI Aji Alex <ajikalex@idbi.co.in<mailto:ajikalex@idbi.co.in>>

> Cc: "JIJO M. JOSE" <jijo.maliam@gmail.com<mailto:jijo.maliam@gmail.com>>
> Subject: Gmail - Financial support-T.K Rajeev Kumar.pdf

>

> Dear Aji

> Please transfer Rupees

> in the mail. Please men [N Gmail

> Johnichan

>

> Thanks and Regards Financial support-T.K Rajeev Kumar

> Revathy Sureshkumar <revathykalaamandhir@yahoo.com> Wed, May 30, 2018 at 1:38 PM

To: "navodayastudio@gmail.com" <navodayastudio@gmail.com>
Dear Jijo

This is Suresh and | am here with Rajeev Kumar at Hyderabad.l am writing this on behalf of T K
Rajeev Kumar.

Rajeev has been admitted for liver transplantation surgery at Yashoda Hospital Hyderabad.As
Rajeev and you had discussed earlier, please send the necessary fund for the surgery and
medical expenses to ;

YASHODA HEALTH CARE SERVICES PVT LTD
AXIS BANK

A/C NO :911020007669171

BRANCH :DILSUKHNAGAR

IFSC-UTIB0000235

Rajeev says he is already having the receipt of Rs.1,00,000/-which you have sent earlier.

Thanking You,
Please requesting your prayers

G.Suresh Kumar
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