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Re: Loan request. Bank Deatails Inbox ×

<jbm102000@yahoo.com>

to Navodaya, me

Varghese Antony

Dear Jijo
I will send the Rs 2.5 lakhs interest free to the account given below on Dec 14th. 
Best Regards
Babu

On Friday, 8 December 2023, 02:29:46 PM IST, Navodaya Studios <navodayastudio@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Babu
I request you give me an interest free loan of ruppees 2.5 Lacs (2,500,00) to tide over this month of December.
The account deatails are as below

Navodaya mobile cinema A/c. No.001005014878 IFS Code ICIC0000010 M.G.Road, Ernakulam 682035

In reply to
From: Varghese Antony <jbm102000@yahoo.com>
Date: Wed, Dec 6, 2023 at 8:10 PM
Subject: Bank Account #
To: Jijo Appachan <jijomary@gmail.com>

Dear Jijo

Please send the bank account # and IFSC code etc for NEFT transfer. I will send it by 14th December by NEFT 

Regards
Babu

<jbm102000@yahoo.com>

to Navodaya, me

Varghese Antony
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